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It’s Siete de Mayo for the very festive among us, but any celebratory follow-through is likely to be muted after this
morning’s disappointing Jobs Report from the Bureau of Labor Statistics. Investors expecting to hear news of 1M new jobs
in April were woefully disappointed with the result of only 266k. And just to make things worse, March’s job growth of
916k was lowered to 770k. Other tidbits falling from today’s statistical pinata were the loss of 111k Temporary Help
positions, a decline of 74k Transportation and Warehousing jobs, and a fall of 79k jobs for Professional and Business
Services. The Manufacturing sector lost 18k jobs while Leisure and Hospitality was the big winner with a re-opening driven
gain of 331k.

Last month’s mixture of winners and losers, along with a 0.2% rise in the Labor Force Participation Rate to 61.7%, resulted
in an unforeseen bump in the Unemployment Rate to 6.1% from 6% versus expectations of a dip to 5.8%. Another
unforeseen bump happened to Average Hourly Earnings with a monthly rise of 0.7% against a pre-release estimate of “no
change.” Year-over-year, that measure came in with a decline of 0.4% against an anticipated rise of 0.3%. This twelve-
month rate was skewed by the deletion from the calculation of last April’s relief-fueled 4.6% monthly jump.

Maybe this morning’s unwelcome news shouldn’t have been all that unexpected in a week that was filled with other
unmet expectations starting with Monday’s PMI reports for Manufacturing. Markit U.S. reported that its Manufacturing
Index fell to 60.5 from 60.6 when it was supposed to move up to 60.7. But that was just a near-miss compared to the
plummet that happened to the Institute of Supply Management’s Index. That measure dropped to 60.7 from 64.7 as
forecasters were looking for 65. The Employment component of that index fell to 55.1 from 59.6 in what now looks like a
harbinger of today’s BLS report. After also learning that Construction Spending only rose 0.2% in March against
predictions of 1.6%, the boost in auto sales reported by Wards Automotive Group was the day’s only bright spot. Total
Vehicle Sales rose to an annualized growth of 18.51M last month from 17.75M while experts were expecting a dip to
17.6M.

Tuesday began with a report from the Census Bureau telling us that the nation’s Trade Balance for all goods and services
grew more deficient with a move in March to minus $74.4B from February’s minus $70.5B. Also from the Census Bureau,
we learned that Factory Orders in March recovered from February’s 0.5% dip with a gain of 1.1%. That was still a little shy
of estimates calling for 1.3%. Orders for Durable Goods also fared well with a March rise of 0.8% that beat the expectation
of a half-percent gain. Likewise for core Capital Goods Orders. March’s rise of 1.2% beat the estimates of 0.9%.

On Wednesday, the Mortgage Bankers Association began the day with the dreary news that Mortgage Applications fell
another 0.9% for the week ending April 30th on the heels of a 2.5% drop the week before. In fact, this measure has been
negative for cinco of the last seis weeks. The ADP Private Payroll report for April wasn’t exactly negative, but it was still a
disappointment. The 742k new private jobs measured in this report looks pretty good against today’s BLS numbers, but it
was still well below the forecasts of 850k. We also got some Service sector news and even with re-opening efforts
steaming ahead, the ISM’s Services Index fell to 62.7 from 63.7 and that was another big miss for those expecting 64.1. A
similar measure from Markit U.S. was a bit more upbeat with its Services index rising to a survey-beating 64.7 from 63.1.

More labor market news came our way yesterday when Challenger, Gray, and Christmas reported that, in April, the year-
over-year pace of Job Cuts fell 96.6%. March’s year-over-year rate of decline was 86.2%. Outcomes like that may have
helped Initial Jobless Claims for the week ending May 1st fall to a new pandemic low of 498k from the prior week’s 553k.
Continuing Claims for the week ending April 24th didn’t get the memo as they rose to 3.69M from 3.65M. We also got
some inflation-related news on Thursday even if it was a little dated. Investors learned from the BLS that, in the first
quarter, Non-farm Productivity leaped by 5.4% soundly beating estimates calling for a 4.3% improvement. This also
helped reverse 2020’s Q4 decline of 3.8%. For Unit Labor Costs, another dominant variable in inflation calculations, that
measure fell 0.3% in Q1 while analysts were looking for a larger drop of 1%. In Q4 of last year, that measure jumped 5.6%.

While today’s Jobs Report has captured the most attention from market participants, there were a few other numbers
this morning. From the Mortgage Bankers Association, we learned that Mortgage Delinquencies rose 6.38% in the first
quarter after rising 6.73% in last year’s Q4. Foreclosure rose 0.54% in Q1 after rising 0.56% the quarter before. We also
learned from the Census Bureau that Wholesale Inventories rose 1.3% in March and that was about what was expected.

What wasn’t expected by anyone was today’s wild ride for Treasuries. Prices were mostly flat prior to this morning Jobs
Report but then gapped up after its release. The Thirty-Year experienced an almost immediate one-point price gain that
pushed that yield down to around 2.20% as the Ten-Year’s yield fell to about 1.50%. Since then, it’s more than given it all
back with long-dated issues actually down slightly for the day as small price gains in the short-end steepen the curve.

If today’s curveball from the BLS is more than you feel like fooling with, margaritas are half-price all week! Be careful out
there.
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